
ARFQ DEP2400000027 LINE     KEMRON ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES INC        GREENBRIER ENVIRONMENTAL GROUP INC        STANTEC CONSULTING SERVICES INC        ENVIROCHECK OF VIRGINIA INC        ENVIROPROBE INTEGRATED SOLUTIONS INC        A ZONE ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES LLC        TRIAD ENGINEERING INC        POTESTA & ASSOCIATES INC        WECI INC   

OER - Environmental Site Assessment    

  1 $14,012.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $13,000.00 $60,000.00 $33,500.00 $7,240.00 $11,000.00 NO BID

  2 $34,012.00 $40,000.00 $30,000.00 $36,000.00 $22,000.00 $59,000.00 $82,800.00 $52,000.00 NO BID

  3 $12,540.00 $1,200.00 $13,200.00 $6,000.00 $15,000.00 $19,200.00 $13,800.00 $39,000.00 NO BID

  4 $10,560.00 $15,000.00 $13,200.00 $12,000.00 $6,000.00 $40,800.00 $41,400.00 $18,000.00 NO BID

  5 $8,220.00 $15,000.00 $13,200.00 $15,000.00 $9,000.00 $32,400.00 $82,800.00 $37,200.00 NO BID

  6 $4,470.00 $4,000.00 $5,640.00 $6,000.00 $3,500.00 $2,900.00 $17,260.00 $14,000.00 NO BID

  7 $4,470.00 $2,000.00 $4,860.00 $6,000.00 $3,500.00 $1,900.00 $6,900.00 $10,000.00 NO BID

  8 $5,700.00 $7,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $16,500.00 $35,000.00 $21,000.00 NO BID

  9 $1,100.00 $5,000.00 $7,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,500.00 $10,000.00 $75,000.00 NO BID

  10 $580.00 $5.00 $5.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $750.00 $6,200.00 $2,000.00 NO BID

  11 $1,812.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,700.00 $1,500.00 $1,700.00 NO BID

  12 $5,012.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $11,560.00 $6,000.00 $8,000.00 NO BID

  13 $10,560.00 $6,000.00 $12,500.00 $11,100.00 $9,000.00 $13,200.00 $9,800.00 $15,000.00 $11,000.00

  14 $8,560.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,500.00 $7,500.00 $9,000.00 $5,600.00 $9,000.00 $3,500.00

  15 $7,564.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $6,500.00 $13,200.00 $9,800.00 $10,000.00 $6,500.00

  16 $8,060.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $9,000.00 $17,500.00 $8,050.00 $10,000.00 $7,500.00

  17 $8,460.00 $6,000.00 $1.00 $7,500.00 $8,000.00 $17,500.00 $10,925.00 $10,000.00 $8,500.00

  18 $1,860.00 $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $28,400.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 NO BID

  19 $812.00 $0.20 $1,000.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $5,600.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00

  20 $2,588.00 $14,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,600.00 $2,645.00 $15,000.00 $16,000.00

  21 $196.00 $200.00 $600.00 $300.00 $240.00 $210.00 $161.00 $200.00 $200.00

  22 $4,940.00 $10,000.00 $9,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,300.00 $11,440.00 $6,500.00 NO BID

  23 $460.00 $1,200.00 $600.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $840.00 $460.00 $600.00 $600.00

  24 $348.00 $800.00 $600.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $840.00 $345.00 $500.00 $600.00

  25 $9,560.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $11,100.00 $10,000.00 $18,500.00 $9,800.00 $13,000.00 $6,500.00

  26 $8,012.00 $5,000.00 $5,600.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,500.00 $8,040.00 $8,500.00 $2,000.00

  Total Bid   $174,468.00 $174,605.20 $182,006.00 $185,000.00 $236,740.00 $376,900.00 $391,966.00 $394,700.00 $67,900.00
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