R & J WELL SERVICE HYDROCARBON WELL HYDROCARBON WELL
INCORPORATED SERVICES INC SERVICES INC 2

ARFQ DEP2600000012

S.R. Hill Well Plugging Project
1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15,000.00 $34,500.00
2 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,550.00 $90,000.00
3 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6,700.00 $95,000.00
4 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,800.00 $5,400.00
5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,600.00 $2,900.00
6 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
7 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
9 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $600.00
10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,000.00
11 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $120.00 $100.00
12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $1,350.00
13 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $750.00
14 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00
15 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10,500.00 $13,750.00
16 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,100.00 $3,250.00
17 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,500.00
18 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,800.00 $95,000.00
19 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00
20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,080.00
21 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250.00
22 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $150.00
23 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $150.00
24 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,800.00 $3,000.00
25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
26 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $750.00
27 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,250.00
28 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,500.00 $2,000.00
29 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,500.00 $2,000.00
30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $1,750.00 $4,900.00
31 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $600.00 $5,000.00
32 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $600.00 $5,500.00
Total Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID $69,070.00 $390,130.00




