
ARFQ DEP2200000039

    UNIVERSAL 

INNOVATIONS 

CONSULTING AND 

CONTRACTING LLC   

    MAIN STREET 

BUILDERS LLC   

    VIRCO 

CONTRACTING 

INC   

    C J HUGHES 

CONSTRUCTION CO 

INC   

AML MAINTENANCE-    

SOUTHERN COUNTIES OF WV $6,900.00 $27,600.00 $8,280.00 $13,800.00

$10,800.00 $14,250.00 $15,000.00 $16,500.00

$8,160.00 $6,000.00 $10,200.00 $11,640.00

$8,400.00 $8,000.00 $9,600.00 $10,560.00

$14,300.00 $19,800.00 $23,100.00 $20,020.00

$13,600.00 $19,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,600.00

$3,600.00 $200.00 $650.00 $560.00

$3,300.00 $300.00 $570.00 $1,260.00

$3,300.00 $300.00 $735.00 $960.00

$5,440.00 $4,000.00 $3,040.00 $8,880.00

$1,350.00 $300.00 $300.00 $660.00

$1,300.00 $800.00 $700.00 $1,260.00

$150,000.00 $90,000.00 $108,000.00 $120,000.00

$2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $2,100.00

$3,900.00 $2,400.00 $2,700.00 $1,320.00

$6,600.00 $4,800.00 $5,100.00 $6,120.00

$7,080.00 $4,800.00 $7,200.00 $7,560.00

$5,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,080.00 $6,720.00

NO BID $250.00 $400.00 $900.00

NO BID $625.00 $1,300.00 $1,500.00

NO BID $750.00 $1,575.00 $750.00

NO BID $1,560.00 $2,080.00 $1,040.00

$2,250.00 $900.00 $1,650.00 $1,950.00

NO BID $100.00 $60.00 $120.00

$10,800.00 $810.00 $14,850.00 $18,630.00

NO BID $100.00 $120.00 $900.00

$8,550.00 $3,000.00 $900.00 $2,100.00

NO BID $1,200.00 $640.00 $1,600.00

NO BID $2,205.00 $3,185.00 $10,780.00

NO BID $3,675.00 $3,920.00 $10,780.00

NO BID $375.00 $550.00 $1,350.00

NO BID $10,000.00 $8,300.00 $16,000.00

$2,650.00 $2,500.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00

NO BID $1,500.00 $20,250.00 $2,550.00

$1,100.00 $2,000.00 $1,050.00 $2,750.00

NO BID $15,500.00 $19,000.00 $22,500.00

NO BID $3,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,750.00

NO BID $1,110.00 $1,980.00 $2,520.00



NO BID $40.00 $64.00 $96.00

NO BID $1,100.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00

NO BID $2,625.00 $2,475.00 $3,750.00

NO BID $2,625.00 $2,475.00 $3,750.00

$8,000.00 $8,750.00 $8,250.00 $12,500.00

$2,100.00 $2,625.00 $2,475.00 $3,750.00

$2,625.00 $2,625.00 $2,475.00 $3,750.00

$2,850.00 $2,625.00 $2,475.00 $3,900.00

NO BID $2,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,600.00

NO BID $4,800.00 $5,600.00 $8,200.00

NO BID $980.00 $1,120.00 $1,568.00

NO BID $7,500.00 $9,000.00 $3,900.00

NO BID $200.00 $1,500.00 $1,840.00

NO BID $800.00 $5,200.00 $8,200.00

NO BID $640.00 $518.00 $680.00

NO BID $800.00 $720.00 $920.00

NO BID $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,800.00

NO BID $2,440.00 $2,160.00 $2,720.00

NO BID $600.00 $495.00 $700.00

NO BID $2,500.00 $9,250.00 $1,875.00

$1,425.00 $1,000.00 $1,400.00 $1,600.00

NO BID $450.00 $990.00 $510.00

$3,600.00 $400.00 $480.00 $704.00

NO BID $600.00 $450.00 $450.00

$144.00 $40.00 $48.00 $80.00

$224.00 $40.00 $48.00 $104.00

NO BID $160.00 $96.00 $144.00

$1,500.00 $30.00 $36.00 $84.00

$560.00 $800.00 $800.00 $2,200.00

$64,000.00 $90,000.00 $100,000.00 $119,000.00

$360.00 $400.00 $400.00 $540.00

NO BID $20,000.00 $25,600.00 $36,000.00

NO BID $400.00 $400.00 $475.00

NO BID $600.00 $1,305.00 $840.00

NO BID $900.00 $1,520.00 $1,950.00

NO BID $1,200.00 $2,090.00 $2,650.00

NO BID $1,400.00 $2,565.00 $3,400.00

NO BID $1,600.00 $2,950.00 $3,700.00

NO BID $800.00 $1,000.00 $2,200.00

NO BID $1,200.00 $1,210.00 $2,500.00

NO BID $1,600.00 $1,450.00 $3,300.00

NO BID $2,000.00 $2,400.00 $4,500.00

NO BID $1,800.00 $1,080.00 $1,320.00

NO BID $2,820.00 $1,400.00 $1,660.00



NO BID $3,340.00 $1,720.00 $2,240.00

NO BID $4,920.00 $2,640.00 $3,400.00

NO BID $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00

NO BID $500.00 $400.00 $500.00

  Total Bid   $368,268.00 $452,885.00 $526,095.00 $624,740.00


